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4. Rationale
With continued decline in the land area available for cultivation, food security can be
achieved only by safeguarding soil health in terms of its physical, biological and
chemical fertility. Soil fertility degradation trigged by nutrient removal through plant
uptake, erosion and leaching, coupled with low application of nutrients through
fertilizers and organic manures/composts is the most important constraint to achieve
food security in many countries. Similarly acidification, salinity, erosion and



contamination also contribute to decline in food production. Soil contamination is a 
major barrier not only to sustain agricultural production but also to produce quality
food.
Many countries are introducing ‘Soil Health Card’ to monitor and manage soil quality to
sustain agricultural production. The soil health card evaluates the health or quality of a
soil as a function of its biophysical characteristics. The card is a tool to help farmers to
monitor and improve soil health based on their own field experience and working
knowledge of their soils. The Soil Health Card is one of the initiatives aimed at
achieving the targeted agricultural production through informed decision on best
management practices.

5. Objectives
The primary aim of this symposium is to examine the nexus between soil quality and
global food security. The symposium will focus on various issues related to soil quality
such as acidification, salinity, contamination, soil erosion and nutrient depletion that are
important in controlling sustainable agricultural production. Major achievements,
challenges, limitations and opportunities of soil quality research in relation to achieving
food security will be explored. Leading research experts and professionals from
industries throughout the world will be brought together to share their knowledge and
expertise to assess recent achievements and propose future directions in soil quality
research.

6. Description
The symposium will give us the opportunity for critical and in-depth discussion on the
sustainable management of soil and water resources. Innovative ideas with experts in
soil quality research will be shared extensively, and new strategies for enhancing
land-based food production will be outlined. The symposium will also provide an
opportunity to initiate the academic network amongst early careers scientists, senior
international soil scientists and professionals from agricultural industries. As soil scientists
we have a major role in educating the general community the nexus between soil
quality and food production, thereby helping the farming community to realize the task
of food security in every part of the world.


